
894 Act No. 210 LAWS OF PENNSYLVANIA,

No. 210

AN ACT

SB 1117

AmendingtheactofJune22,1931 (P.L.594),entitled“An actestablishingcertain
townshiproadsasStatehighways;authorizingtheir construction,mainl:enance,
and improvement under certain conditions and restrictions; limiting the
obligation of the Commonwealthin the constructionof certain st:ructures
locatedon suchhighways;conferringcertainpowersupon the Departmentof
Highways and local authorities,persons,associationsand corporationsfor
sharingthe cost of the maintenanceandconstructionof suchhighways;and
makinganappropriationtocarryouttheprovisionsof saidact,” deletinga route
in DauphinCounty.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section1. Thefollowing routeestablishedby theact ofJune22, 1931
(P.L.594),entitled “An act establishingcertaintownship roadsas State
highways;authorizingtheirconstruction,maintenance,andimprovement
undercertain conditionsand restrictions; limiting the obligation of the
Commonwealthin the constructionof certainstructureslocatedon such
highways;conferringcertainpowersupon the Departmentof Highways
andlocalauthorities,persons,associationsandcorporationsfor sharingthe
cost of the maintenanceandconstructionof suchhighways;andmaking
an appropriation to carry out the p:rovisions of said act,” and its
amendments,is deletedas follows:

DauphinCounty

[Route22057. Beginningat a pointon Route22001immediatelyeastof the
boroughline of Millersburg Borough; thencein a southerlydirection through
UpperPaxtonTownshipto the Millersburg Borough-UpperPaxtonTownship
line, in DauphinCounty,adistanceof about0.13 of a mile.]

Section 2. This act shall takeeffect immediately.

APPRovED—The6th day of October,A. D. 1972.

MILTON J. SHAPP

Theforegoingis atrue and correctcopy of Act of the GeneralAssembly

No. 210.

ci.
Secretary of the Commonwealth.


