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No. 141

AN ACT

HB 903

Relating to certification of teachersin the public schoolsof the Commonwealth
andcreatinga ProfessionalStandardsandPracticesCommission.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section1. Definitions.—Whenusedin this act, the following words
andphrasesshallhavethe following meanings:

(1) “Teacher”shall meananypersonwho holdsa valid Pennsylvania
teachingcertificate.

(2) “Teach” shallmeanto engagein thepracticeof teachingin the
public schoolsof the Commonwealthor to provide relatededucational
specialist,administrativeor supervisoryservicesin suchschools.

(3) “Commission”shallmeanthe ProfessionalStandardsandPractices
Commission.

(4) “Educationspecialist”shallmeanapersonemployedby a public
school as a certifiedguidancecounselor,nurse,homeandschoolvisitor,
psychologist,dentalhygienist, instructionalmediaspecialistor nutrition
specialist.

Section2. Certification Requirements.—Nopersonshall teachin a
public school in the Commonwealthunlesshe hasmet the certification
requirementsas establishedby the StateBoardof Educationwhich are
applicableto the institution wherehe is employed.

Section3. ProfessionalStandardsandPracticesCommission.—There
is herebycreateda ProfessionalStandardsand PracticesCommission
consistingof sixteenmembersappointedby the Governor.The term of
office of membersof the commission,exceptthestudentmemberwhose
term shallbe oneyear,shallbe threeyearscommencingon January1 of
theyear following their appointment,exceptthat original appointments
shallbe for staggeredtermsof one, two andthreeyearsin order that the
termsof five membersof thecommissionshallexpireeachyearthereafter.
Vacanciesshall be filled for an unexpiredterm in the samemanneras
original appointments. No person shall serve for more than two
consecutivetermsas amemberof the commission.The Governormay
removeanymemberfromthe commissionfor misconductormalfeasance
in office, incapacity,or neglectof duty. All membersof the commission
shallbe residentsof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvania.

Section4. MembershipandQualifications.—(a)The membershipof
the ProfessionalStandardsandPracticesCommissionshall consistof:

(1) Eight classroomteachers,including one educationalspecialist,
broadlyrepresentativeof the teachingprofessionfrom public schools.

(2) Threeadministratorsfrom public schools.
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(3) Two faculty members from approved institutions of higher
learning in the Commonwealthoffering approved teachereducation
programs.

(4) Oneadministratorfrom anapprovedinstitutionof higherlearning
in the Commonwealthoffering approvedteachereducationprograms.

(5) One collegestudentcurrently enrolled in a programof teacher
education in an approved institution of higher learning in the
Commonwealthoffering approvedteachereducationprograms.

(6) One memberfrom the generalpublic who shallbe a parentof a
pupil attendinga public school.

(b) Except for the representativeof the general public, and the
student representative,the Governor in making appointmentsshall
consider recommendationsfrom panels of nominees submitted by
Statewideorganizationsof professionaleducatorswhich certify that the
panels include only representativesof the category of professional
personnelfor which the panelor panelsof nomineesaresubmitted.

(c) All membersof the commissionexceptthe personsrepresenting
the collegestudentsandgeneralpublic shallhavebeenactively engaged
in teaching or providing related educational, administrative or
supervisoryservicesin a public schoolor approvedinstitution of higher
educationwith approvedteachereducationprogramsfor at leastfive of
the eight years immediately preceding their appointment. A person
appointedto the commissionwho leavesthe Commonwealthto become
domiciled in anotherstateor whoseemployment statuschangesto a
categorydifferent from that for which he was appointedshallhavehis
position on the commissiondeemedvacated.

Section 5. Power and Duties.—(a)The ProfessionalStandardsand
PracticesCommissionshallhavethe powerand its duty shallbe:

(1) To recommendto the State Board of Education standardsfor
certification of teachersto render professionalservicesin the public
schoolsof the Commonwealthandfor accreditationof teachereducation
programsand to evaluateteachereducationand certification program
servicesand activities to determine the effectivenessin terms of the
annualand long-rangeprogramplansandto recommendchangesto the
State Boardof Educationas indicatedby suchevaluations.

(2) To recommendto the State Board of Education standardsof
professionalpractice for teachersin public schools.Nothing contained
herein is intended to confer upon the State Board of Education the
authority to suspend,annul or revoketeachingcertificatesother than as
is otherwiseprovidedin law.

(3) To recommendto theStateBoardof Educationprocedureswhich
assurethat actionsconcerningsuspension,annulmentor revocationof
teachingcertificatesshall comply with due process.

(4) In order to make therecommendationsreferredto in subsections
(1), (2) and (3) above, the Departmentof Education shall furnish all
informationthe commissiondeemsnecessary.
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(5) To adoptrulesandregulationsasmaybenecessaryto carryout the
purposesof this act. Thecommissionshallholdpublic hearingsand take
testimony concerning proposed recommendations which shall be
presentedto the State Boardof Education.

(6) Nothingin this act shallbe construedto preventorganizationsof
theteachingprofessionfrom adoptingmeasuresdesignedto improvethe
standardsand practicesof ethics and academicfreedomamong their
membersand in their relationshipswith otherpersonsand groups.

(b) All teachers’certificatesin force in this Commonwealthat the
timethis actgoesinto effect shallcontinuein full forceandeffect,subject
to all the termsandconditionsunderwhich theywere issued,until they
expireby virtue of their own limitations,unlessthey aresoonerannulled
for the reasonsand in the mannerprovidedby law.

Section 6. Organization and Meetings of the Commission.—The
commissionshallannuallyselectachairmanandvice-chairmanby ballot.
Meetingsshall be held at least four times per year at the call of the
chairmanor upon requestin writing of a majority of the commission.A
majority shall constitutea quorum anda majority of such quorumshall
haveauthority to act upon any matterproperly beforethe commission.
Thefirst meetingof the commissionshallbeheldwithin six monthsof the
effectivedateof this act. Meetingsof thecommissionshallbe opento the
public andthe Director of ProfessionalStandardsand Practicesshallbe
responsiblefor seeingthat notices of meetings of the commissionare
properlycirculated.

Section 7. Expenses.—Membersof the commissionshall receiveno
compensationfor their services,but shallbe reimbursedfor their actual
and necessary expenses incurred in the performance of official
commissionbusiness.A memberof the commissionwho is anemployeof
an agencyof the Commonwealth,or any of its political subdivisions
including school districts, shall be permitted to attend commission
meetingsandperformothercommissiondutieswithout lossof incomeor
otherbenefits.A memberof thecommissionwho isemployedby aprivate
employershallbereimbursedfor anyincomelostasa resultof-attendance
at commission meetings or performanceof other official commission
duties.

Section8. Director of ProfessionalStandardsand Practices.—There
shallbe aDirector of ProfessionalStandardsandPracticeswho shallserve
astheexecutiveofficerandsecretaryof thecommission.Thedirectorshall
be appointedby the Secretaryof Educationafter consultationwith the
commission.TheDepartmentof Educationshallprovide adequatespace,
equipment,staff, secretarialandadministrativeassistanceto facilitatethe
activities of the commission.

Thecommissionshallkeepminutesof its meetingsandreportannually
to the Governor,the GeneralAssembly,the teachingprofessionandthe
public.
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Section 9. Professional Standards Committee; Abolition.—The
ProfessionalStandardsCommitteeestablishedunderChapter49 of the
Regulationsof the State Boardof Educationis herebyabolished.

Section 10. Effective Date.—Thisact shall takeeffect immediately.

APPROVED—The12thday of December,A. D. 1973.

MILTON J. SHAPP

The foregoingis a true andcorrectcopy of Act of the GeneralAssembly
No. 141.

ci.
Secretaryof the Commonwealth.


