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Amending the act of December5, 1936 (2nd Sp.Sess.,1937 P.L.2897, No.1),
entitled “An act establishinga systemof unemploymentcompensationto be
administeredby the Departmentof Labor and Industry and its existingand
newly createdagencieswith personnel(with certainexceptions)selectedon a
civil servicebasis;requiringemployersto keeprecordsand makereports,and
certainemployersto paycontributionsbasedon payrollstoprovide moneysfor
the payment of compensationto certain unemployed persons;providing
procedureand administrative details for the determination,payment and
collection of such contributions and the payment of such compensation;
providing for cooperationwith the FederalGovernmentand its agencies;
creating certain special funds in the custody of the State Treasurer;and
prescribingpenalties,”changingthe amount of certain contributionsby the
Commonwealth.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section 1. Section 1003,act of December5, 1936 (2nd Sp.Sess.,1937
P.L.2897, No.1), known as the “Unemployment CompensationLaw,”
addedSeptember27, 1971 (P.L.460,No.108),is amendedto read:

Section 1003. Contributions.—(a) In lieu of contributionsrequired
to be paid by employers under this act, the Commonwealth of
Pennsylvaniashall payinto the UnemploymentCompensationFundan
amount[equivalent to the amountof compensationpaid to claimants and
charged to its accountin accordancewith the provisionsof section302 (a)
of this act.] equalto theamountof regularbenefitsandofone-half-ofthe
extendedbenefitspaid, (after December31, 1978 the full amount of
extendedbenefitspaid) that is attributableto servicein theemployof the
Commonwealth and all its departments, bureaus, boards, agencies,
commissionsandauthorities.

(b) The amount which the Commonwealthshall pay into the
UnemploymentCompensationFund,as hereinaboveset forth, shall be
computedby the departmentandreportedquarterlyto theStateTreasurer
who shall thereuponpay such amount from the GeneralFund of the
Commonwealth,upon approvalthereofin accordancewith thelawthenin
effect, exceptthat to the extentthat compensationis paid on the basisof
wagespaid by an authority of the Commonwealthfrom its funds such
authority shall pay suchamountinto the UnemploymentCompensation
Fundfrom its own funds.

Section2. The act shall take effect immediately and shall be
retroactiveto January1, 1978.

APPROVED—The1st day of July, A. D. 1978.

MILTON J. SHAPP


