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AN ACT

HB 1851

Amendingtheact of April 29, 1937 (P.L.487,No.115),entitled,asamended,“An
actto providefor thepermanentpersonalregistrationof electors-incities ofthe
secondclass,cities of the secondclass A, cities of the third class,boroughs,
towns, and townshipsas a condition of their right to vote at electionsand
primaries,and their enrollment as membersof political partiesas a further
conditionof theirrighttovoteat primaries;prescribingcertainprocedurefor the
conductof electionsandprimariesand thechallengeandproofofqualifications
of electors;requiringthecountycommissionersof thevariouscountiestoactasa
registrationcommissiontherefor; and prescribingthe powersand dutiesof
citizens, parties, political bodies, registrationcommissions,commissioners,
registrars, inspectors of registration and other appointeesof registration
commissions,county election boards,election officers, municipal officers,
departmentsand bureaus,police officers, courts, judges, prothonotaries,
sheriffs, county commissioners,peace officers, county treasurers,county
controllers,registrarsof vital statistics,certainpublic utility corporations,real
estatebrokers,rentalagents,andboardsof school directors;and imposing
penalties,”authorizingchangeof registrationby mail.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section 1. Theact of April 29, 1937(P.L.487,No.115),knownas“The
PermanentRegistrationAct for Cities of the SecondClass,Cities of the
Second Class A, Cities of the Third Class, Boroughs, Towns, and
Townships,”reenactedand amendedMay 31, 1955 (P.L.62, No.32), is
amendedby addinga sectionto read:

Section17.2. Change0/Registrationby MaiL—(a) Afly registered
electormay changehis registration in the samemanner as section17.1
providesfor registration bymaiL

(b) TheSecretaryoftheCommonwealthshallcausetobepreparedand
printed at the expenseof the Commonwealth forms upon which a
registeredelectormaychangehis registrationbymailin asknfathionao
providedfor in section17.1.

Section 2. This act shall takeeffect in 60 days.

APPROVED—The26thday of November,A. D. 1978.

MILTON J. SHAPP


