
8 Act 1984-3 LAWS OFPENNSYLVANIA

No. 1984-3

AN ACT

SB 504

Amendingtheactof May21,1943 (P.L.57l,No.254),entitled,asamended,“An
act relating to assessmentfor taxation in countiesof the fourth, fifth, sixth,
seventhand eighth classes;designating the subjects,property andpersons
subject to andexemptfrom taxationfor county, borough,town, township,
school, except in cities andcounty institutiondistrictpurposes;andproviding
for andregulatingtheassessmentandvaluationthereoffor suchpurposes;cre-
ating in eachsuchcounty a boardfor the assessmentand revision of taxes;
definingthepowersand dutiesof suchboards;providingfor theacceptanceof
this act by cities; regulatingthe office of ward, borough,town andtownship
assessors;abolishingthe office of assistanttriennial assessorin townshipsof
the first class; providing for the appointmentof a chief assessor,assistant
assessorsandotheremployes;providing for their compensationpayableby
suchcounties;prescribingcertaindutiesof andcertain feesto be collectedby
the recorder of deedsand municipal officers who issue building permits;
imposing dutieson taxablesmaking improvementson land andgranteesof
land; prescribingpenalties;andeliminating the triennial assessment,”further
providingfor assessmentswhensewerconnectionbansareimposed.

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsasfollows:

Section1. Section 204 of the act of May 21, 1943 (P.L.57l, No.254),
known as The Fourth to Eighth Class County AssessmentLaw, added
December22, 1977(P.L.347,No.103),is amendedto read:

Section204. TemporaryAssessmentChangefor RealEstateSubjectto a
SewerConnectionBan Order.—Whena departmentor agencyof the Com-
monwealthor a municipalityhasordereda sewerconnectionbanbecauseof
a lack of adequatesewagetreatmentfacilities, the realestateaffectedby the
order shall be reassessedfor the duration of the order [or for two years,
whicheveris the shorter period of time]. Forthepurposesof this section,the
phrase“affected by the order” shall be definedas the applicationfor a
building permitandthedenialto theapplicantof permissiontoproceedwith
the building or constructionbecauseof a sewerbanorder.The reassessment
shall be basedon the bestuse of the landduring the periodof the reassess-
ment.

Section2. This act shallapplyto sewerconnectionbansin effecton and
after theeffectivedateof this act.

Section3. Thisact shalltakeeffectimmediately.

APPROVED—The9thdayof February,A. D. 1984.

DICK THORNBURGH


