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No. 2002-216

AN ACT

SB 1453

Authorizing the Department of General Services, with the approval of the
Departmentof Transportationand theGovernor,to grantandconveytotheWest
ChesterArea SchoolDistrict certain lands in West GoshenTownship,Chester
County; and authorizingthe releaseof Project 500 restrictions imposed on
certainland ownedby the Boroughof Royalton. DauphinCounty,andimposing
Project 500 restrictions on other land owned by the Borough of Royalton,
DauphinCounty.

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsasfollows:

Section 1. Conveyancein WestGoshenTownship.ChesterCounty.
(a) Authorization.—The Departmentof General Services, with the

approvalof the Departmentof Transportationandthe Governor,is hereby
authorizedon behalfof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniato grantand
convey to the West Chester Area School District, the Departmentof
Transportation’sChesterCountyMaintenanceFacility, landandbuildings
described in subsection (b) for fair market value as determinedby
independentappraisal.

(b) Legal descriptionof land.—Thepropertytobeconveyedpursuantto
this sectionconsistsof the Departmentof Transportation’sChesterCounty
MaintenanceFacility, boundedandmoreparticularlydescribedas all that
certainpieceor parcelof land in WestGoshenTownship,ChesterCounty,
Pennsylvania,boundedanddescribedasfollows:

PARCEL 1
BEGINNING at apoint,an iron pipe,in the landsof EdwardHaleyand

ThomasF. Haley(Deceased)on theproductionof thenorth building line of
Biddle Street,saidpoint being 16.11 feet in an easterlydirection from a
brassplug in the concreteroadwayof StateHighway Application 7326;
thencealongsaidStateHighwayApplication N. 23 degreesW. adistanceof
330.31 feet to an iron pipe, the corner of lands of Edward Haley and
ThomasF. Haley (Deceased)andtheWestChesterNurseryCompan)r,said
iron pipe being 16.11 feet in an easterlydirection from abrassplug in the
concreteroadwayof StateHighway Application 7326:thenceby thelandsof
Edward Haley and ThomasF. Haley, (Deceased)and the West Chester
NurseryCompanyN. 67 degreesE. a distanceof 534.00feet to aconcrete
monument in the line of lands of HannahParker:thenceby the landsof
Edward Haley. andThomasF. Haley (Deceased)and HannahParkerS. 26
degrees52 minutes42 secondsE. a distanceof 131.13 feet to a point;
thenceby the landsof EdwardHaley andThomasF. Haley (Deceased)and
GeorgeH. Kelling S. 26 degrees52 minutes42 secondsE. a distanceof59
feet to apoint: thencethru thelandsof EdwardHaleyandThomasF.Haley
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(Deceased)S.26 degrees52 minutes42 secondsE. a distanceof 52.00feet
to an iron pipe; thencecontinuing thru the lands of Edward Haley and
ThomasF. Haley (Deceased)S. 22 degrees05 minutesE. a distanceof
86.07 feet, to aniron pipeon the productionof theNorth Building Line of
Biddle Street; thencealong the production of the north building line of
Biddle Street, thru the lands of Edward Haley and Thomas F. Haley
(Deceased)S. 66 degrees44 minutesW. a distanceof 542.00 feet to the
pointof BEGINNING.
Containing4.110acres,bethesamemoreor less.

PARCEL2
TRACT 1 - BEGINNING at an iron pipe on the easterly side of

MontgomeryAvenue.StateApplication 7326.saidpipe beingon the legal
right of way line andon the line dividing the landsof EdwardD. Flaleyand
the Commonwealthof Pennsylvania,Departmentof Highways; thence
along lands of the said Commonwealthof Pennsylvania,Departmentof
Highways, North sixty six degrees,forty four minutesEast,a distanceof
five hundredforty nine (549.00) feetto an iron pipe in the line of landsof
E. Duie PyleSouthtwentytwo degrees,five minutesEast,a distanceof one
hundredfifty six andthirty hundreths(156.30)feet to an iron pipe; thence
Southsixty sevendegreesWest,adistanceof five hundredforty six andfifty
hundredths(546.50) feet to an iron pipe on the easterly side of said
MontgomeryAvenue.State Aid Application 7326: thencealong the legal
right of way line of saidMontgomeryAvenue.StateAid Application7326,
North twentythreedegreesWest.adistanceof onehundredfifty threeand
forty four hundredths(153.44) feet to the point of BEGINNING and
containingoneandnine thousandfour hundredfifty four ten thousandths
(1.9454)acresmore or less,with the privilege of enteringupon adjoining
land to cleantheaforesaidditch andsubjectto theprivilegeto-the~wnersof
adjoininglandthroughwhichthe saidditch passesof enteringuponthelots
herebygranted and cleaning the said ditch wheneverit may become
obstructed.

TRACT 2 - BEGINNING at an iron pipe on the easterly side of
MontgomeryAvenue.State Aid Application 7326.saidpipe beingon the
legal right of way line andthe line of landsof EdwardD. Hale)r, thence
North sixty sevendegreesEast,adistanceof five hundredforty six andfifty
hundredths(546.50) feet to an iron pipe in line of landsof E. Duie Pyle;
thencealong the landsof E. Duie Pyle South seventeendegreesforty four
minutesEast.adistanceof eighteenandninetyninehundredths~18.99)feet
toan iron pipein theline of landsof theWestChesterPaperBox Company,
Inc.; thencealong the landsof saidWestChesterPaperBox CompanyInc.
andEdwardD. Haley Southsixty sevendegrees.six minutes,thirty seconds
West,a distanceof five hundredforty five (545.00)feet to an iron pipe on
theeasterlysideof saidMontgomeryAvenue,StateAid Application 7326;
thencealong the legal right of way line of saidMontgomeryAvenue,State
Aid Application 7326. North twenty threedegreesWest, a distanceof
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seventeenand eighty eight hundredths(17.88) feet to the point of
BEGINNING and containing two thousand two hundred forty one ten
thousandths(0.2241)acresmoreor less, with theprivilegeof enteringupon
adjoininglandto cleanthe aforesaidditch andsubjectto theprivilege tothe
ownersof adjoining land through which the said ditch passesof entering
upon the lots hereby grantedand cleaning said ditch whenever it may
becomeobstructed.

(c) Conditions.—Theconveyanceshall be madeunderandsubjecttoall
lawful andenforceableeasements,servitudesandrightsofothers,including,
but not confinedto. streets,roadwaysandrightsof anytelephone,telegraph,
water, electric, gasor pipelinecompanies,as well as underandsubjectto
any lawful and enforceableestatesor tenanciesvested in third persons
appearingof record, for any portion of the land or improvementserected
thereon.

(d) Deed.—Thedeedof conveyanceshall be by specialwarrantydeed
andshall be executedby the Secretaryof GeneralServicesin thenameof
theCommonwealthof Pennsylvania.

(e) Costsand fees.—Costsand feesincidental to this conveyanceshall
beborneby the grantee.

(I) Depositof proceeds.—Theproceedsfrom the saleshall bedeposited
in the Motor License Fund to pay for costs and fees incurred for a new
ChesterCountyMaintenanceFacility aswell as thecostsandfeesincurred
by the Departmentof GeneralServicesas authorizedundersection 2406-A
of theactof April 9, 1929 (P.L.l77,No.175).known as The Administrative
Codeof 1929.

(g) Alternate disposition.—In the event that this conveyanceis not
executedwithin 12 monthsof the effectivedateof this act, thepropertymay
be disposedof in accordancewith section 2406-A of The Administrative
Codeof 1929.Theproceedsfrom the saleshall bedepositedin accordance
with subsection(I).
Section2. Boroughof Royalton.

(a) Authorization to release restrictions.—Theland described in
subsection(b) is herebyreleasedfrom any restrictionsor encumbranceson
the title resulting from the provisionsof the act of January19, 1968 (1967
P.L.996, No.443), kiiown as The Land and Water Conservation and
ReclamationAct, in exchangefor the imposition of the Land andWater
Conservationand Reclamation Act provisions on land owned by the
Boroughof Royaltonanddescribedin subsection(c).

(b) Descriptionof land to be releasedof restrictions.—All that certain
parcel of land located in the Borough of Royalton, Dauphin County,
Pennsylvania,boundedanddescribedasfollows:

Beginningat a monumenton the southerlysideof CanalStreet;thence
south 10 degrees03 minuteswestalong the easterlysideof a privateroad,
123.55feetto aspike; thencesouth79 degrees50 minuteswest 100feettoa
spike in the easterly line of lands,now or late, of MargaretEllen Kerr
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Beckley; thencenorth 12 degrees42minuteseast97.46feet to aspikein the
southerlyline of CanalStreet: thencealong the southernline of saidCanal
Street,north 75 degrees50 minuteseast45.51 feet to a spike; thencestill
along the southerlyline of saidCanalStreet,south07 degrees40 minutes
east,54.50feetto amonument,theplaceof beginning.

Being the same premises which Kenneth P. Dudley and Doris M.
Dudley, his wife, by DeeddatedAugust7, 1984.andrecordedin theOffice
of Recorderof Deeds.DauphinCounty,Pennsylvania.in RecordBook526,
atpage252,grantedandconveyedto the Borough of Royalton.And being
alsoTract2 upon which the Boroughof Royaltonby deeddatedSeptember
26, 1988,andrecordedin theOfficeof Recorderof Deeds,DauphinCounty,
Pennsylvania.in Record Book 1179,at page363. previouslyimposedthe
restrictionthat the saidTract 2 be usedfor municipalpark, recreationand
open spacepurposesas definedin the Land and WaterConservationand
ReclamationAct.

(c) Description of land to be restricted.—All of that certainportionof
landin the Boroughof Royalton,DauphinCounty.Pennsylvania,bounded
anddescribedas follows:

Beginningat a point atthe intersectionof the northernright-of-wayline
of Burd Street(50’ wide) with the easternline of landsnow or formerlyof
Amtrak. said point also being at the southwest corner of the herein
describedLot No. 2; thence,alongtheaforementionedlandsof Amtrak, and
along the westernside of a 10 feet wide drainageeasement,North 19
degrees32 minutes24 secondsWest, 143.21 feet to a concretemonument
(set); thence,alongLot No. 1, as shownon theabovereferencedplan,South
84 degrees30 minutes00 secondsEast,142.39feetto aconcretemonument
(set); thence,continuing along the aforementionedLot No. 1, along the
westernsideof a25 feet wide accessandutility easement,South05 degrees
30 minutes00 secondsWest, 129.75feetto a 3/4 inch rebarwith cap(set)at
the northernright-of-way line of the aforementionedBurd Street; thence,
along said right-of-way line and along the southern side of the
aforementioneddrainageeasement.North 84 degrees30 minutes 00
secondsWest, 81.77 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing 14,542.6
squarefeet or 0.3339 acres. Identified as “Lot No. 2”, on a plan titled,
“Final SubdivisionPlan for Boroughof Royalton”.preparedby Light-Heigel
& Associates,Inc.. datedJuly 26. 2002,Job Number02-0372,recordedin
the Office of Recorderof Deeds.DauphinCounty, Pennsylvania,in Plan
Book I. Volume 8, atPage95, andbeinga portion of thepieceor parcelof
land which the Middletown Area School District by deeddatedJune 25,
2001,andrecordedin the Office of Recorderof Deeds,DauphinCounty,
Pennsylvania.in RecordBook 4042.at page492 grantedandconveyedto
the Borough of Royalton.Togetherwith the right of ingress,egress,and
regress,from Burd Street.over andacrossa 25 feetwide accessandutility
easementover landsgrantedand conveyedto the Boroughof Royaltonby
the aforesaiddeedof June 25. 2001,saideasementbeingset forth on the
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aforesaidFinalSubdivisionPlan,andsaideasementbeing furtherdescribed
as follows: Beginning at a 3/4 inch rebar with cap (set) on the northern
right-of-way line of Burd Street (50’ wide) in the Borough of Royalton,
DauphinCounty.Pennsylvania,saidrebarbeingat thesoutheastcornerof
Lot No. 2, atacornercommonto landsnowor formerlyof theBoroughof
Royalton(Lot No. 1) as shownon theabovereferencedplan,saidpointalso
beingat thesouthwestcornerof thehereindescribedProposed25 feetWide
AccessandUtility Easementon theabovereferencedplan; thence,along the
aforementionedLot No. 2, North 05 degrees30 minutes00 secondsEast,
129.75 feet to a concrete monument (set); thence, through the
aforementionedlands of the Borough of Royalton. South 84 degrees,30
minutes,00 secondsEast.25.00feet to apoint, thence,along landsnowor
formerly of Michael S. Richards,describedin Deed Book 2429, at Page
110, South05 degrees30 minutes00 secondsWest.129.75 to apin (found)
on thenorthernright-of-wayline of theaforementionedBurd Street; thence,
alongsaidright-of-way line, North84 degrees30 minutes00 secondsWest,
25.00feet tothePoint of theBeginning.

(d) Authorization to imposerestrictions.—Thefollowing restriction
shall beaddedtothedeedfor the landdescribedin subsection(C):

This land is to beusedfor municipal park.recreationandopenspace
purposes as defined in The Land and Water Conservationand
ReclamationAct.

(e) Special account.—Further,in considerationfor releasing the
restrictionson the propertydescribedin subsection(b), the boroughshall
placein aspecialaccountof the boroughanamountof moneyequalto the
fair market value of this property. For purposesof this section,the fair
marketvaluehasbeendeterminedto be $16.500.Within five yearsof the
effective dateof this section,thismoneyshall beusedexclusively to make
improvementsto existing borough-ownedparks and playgrounds in
accordancewith a planapprovedby the Departmentof Conservationand
NaturalResources,Bureauof RecreationandConservation.

• Section3. Effectivedate.
Thisactshall takeeffect immediately.

APPRova—The9th dayof December,A.D. 2002.

MARK S. SCHWEIKER


