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No. 289

AN ACF

HB 2450

Authorizing the Departmentof PropertyandSuppliesto subleaseto Gaudenzia,
Inc., landacquiredandconstructioncompletedby TheGeneralStateAuthority
for a ResidentTreatmentand ResearchCenter for Victims of Addictive
Diseases.

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section 1. Upon the acquisition of the OakbournePropertyand
completionof ProjectNo. 558-1 by The GeneralStateAuthority for a
ResidentTreatment and ResearchCenter for Victims of Addictive
Diseases,asprovidedfor in theactofJuly 20, 1968 (Act No.220),entitled
“An actamendingthe actof March31, 1949 (P.L372), entitled ‘An act
to promotethewelfareof thepeopleof theCommonwealth;creatingThe
GeneralStateAuthority as a body corporateand politic with powerto
construct,improve,equip,furnish,andoperateprojects,andto leasethe
same,andto fix fees,rentals,andchargesfor theusethereof;authorizing
andregulatingtheissuanceof bondsfor saidAuthority, andprovidingfor
the paymentof suchbonds,and therights of the holdersthereof;andto
enterinto agreementswith the Governmentof the UnitedStatesor any
Federalagency;andauthorizingtheDepartmentof PropertyandSupplies
to grant, assign, convey, or lease to the Authority lands of the
Commonwealthand interests therein, and to acquire lands therefor;
granting the right of eminent domain; empoweringThe GeneralState
Authority to sell andconveyprojectsandpropertyto theCommonwealth;
andprovidingthatno debtof theCommonwealthshallbeincurredin the
exercise of any of the powersgrantedby this act,’ empoweringthe
Authority to construct and acquire projectsfor certain State-related
universities;providing for the dispositionof unusedborrowing capacity
which may becomeavailable through the operation of the Higher
EducationFacilitiesAct of 1963 or otherFederalgrants;harmonizingthe
language of certain existing amendments;allocating unused funds;
providingfor theinterpretationof certainamendmentsto the act; further
defining the powersandproceduresof the board; regulatingthe leasing
ofprojectsconstructedfor State-aidedinstitutions;amendingtheeminent
domain powersand proceduresof the Authority; specifically itemizing
projectsfor capital budgetpurposes,”and the leasing thereof to the
Commonwealthof Pennsylvania, the Departmentof Property and
Supplies,with the approvalof the Governor,is herebyauthorizedand
directed to subleasefor the rental of onedollar ($1.00) per annumto
Gaudenzia,Inc., with offices at 1834 West Tioga Street,Philadelphia,
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Pennsylvania,saidproperty upon such termsandconditionsas shall be

agreedupon.
Section 2. The subleaseshall be preparedby the Department of

Justiceandexecutedby the Secretaryof PropertyandSupplieswith the
approvalof the Governor andshall be subject to terminationby the
Department of Property and Supplies with the approval of the
Departmentof Public Welfareif the property is not used as a resident
treatmentand researchcenterfor victims of addictivediseases.

Section3. During the term of said subleaseor anyrenewalthereof,
Gaudenzia,Inc. shall be subjectto the laws of the Commonwealthof
Pennsylvaniaand the rules and regulations promulgated by any
department,boardor commissionof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvania
or any agencygoverningprivatenonprofit institutions.

Section4. This actshall takeeffect immediately.

APPROVED—The10thday of December,A. D. 1970.

RAYMOND P. SHAFER

The foregoingis a trueandcorrectcopy of Act of the GeneralAssembly
No. 289.

Secretaryof the Commonwealth.


