
466 Act No. 148 LAWS OF PENNSYLVANIA,

No. 148

AN ACT

HB 1705

AmendingtheactofJuly 28,1953(P.L.723),entitled,asamended,“An actrelating
to counties of the second class and second class A; amending,r~vising,
consolidatingandchangingthe laws relating thereto,”reducingcertain age
requirements.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section 1. Section 413, act of July 28, 1953 (P.L.723),known as the
“Second Class County Code,” added August 14, 1963 (P.L.840), is
amendedto read:

Section413.Qualificationsof ElectedCountyOfficers.—Nopersonshall
be elected to any county office, except the office of district attorney
otherwiseprovidedfor by this act, unlesshe shallbe at least[twenty-one]
eighteenyearsof age,acitizenof the United Statesanda residentof the
county, and shall have residedwithin the county for one year next
precedinghis election.

Section 2. Clause(2) of section 1206 of the act is amendedto read:
Section 1206. Deputy Sheriffs; Qualifications.—A sheriff shall not

appoint anypersona chiefdeputyor any otherdeputysheriff unlessthe
sheriff files with the prothonotary,prior to the appointment of such
person, the name and photographof such person, together with an
affidavit of suchpersonsettingforth the following:

(2) That he is a citizen of the United Statesand[twenty-one] eighteen
yearsof ageor over;

Section3. Subsection(a) of section1401 of the act, amendedAugust14,
1963 (P.L.840), is amendedto read:

Section 1401. District Attorney; Qualifications; Eligibility.—.(a) The
district attorneyshallbe a residentof the county and shallhaveresided
in the county for which he is electedor appointedfor two yearsnext
precedinghis electionor appointment,shall be learnedin the law and
admittedto practicein the courtsof this Commonwealth,shallbeat least
[twenty-one] eighteenyearsof ageand acitizen of the United States.

***

Section 4. Section 1510 of the act, amendedDecember 16, 1965
(P.L.1115),is amendedto read:

Section 1510. Application for Examination for Appointment to the
Police Force or as Fireman or Fire Inspector.—Eachpersondesiring
appointmentto thepoliceforceor asa firemanor fire in-spectorshallapply
to the commissionfor examination,andshall file with the commissiona
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formal application, as provided by it, and shall state,under oath or
affirmation, (1) his full nameandresidenceor postoffice address,(2) his
citizenship,placeanddateof birth, (3) hisconditionof healthandphysical
capacity for public service, (4) his businessor employment and his
residencefor the pastfive years,and(5) suchotherinformation asmaybe
required by the commission’s rules and regulations, showing the
applicant’squalificationsfor theposition for which he is being examined.

No personshallbe eligible to apply for examinationunlesshe is more
than[twenty-one]eighteenyearsof ageand,with respectto applicantsfor
thepoliceforce not overthirty-five yearsof ageat thedateof application,
andhasbeenaresidentof the countyfor at leasttwo yearsimmediately
precedinghis applicationunlessno residentapplicantsareavailable.

APPROVED—The 16thday of June,A. D. 1972.

MILTON J. SHAPP

The foregoingis a true andcorrectcopyof Act of the GeneralAssembly
No. 148.

c~.
Secretaryof the Commonwealth.


