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No. 1977-83

AN ACT

1-113 677

Prohibiting employersfrom firing employeeswho losetime from employmentin

the line of duty as volunteerfiremen and providing penalties.
The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby

enactsas follows:

Section 1. No employer shall terminate an employeewho is a
volunteerfiremanand in theline ofdutyhasrespondedto acallpriortcithe
time he was due to report for work resultingin a lossof time from his
employment.

Section2. Any time lost from employmentas providedin section 1
may be chargedto the employee’sregular pay.

Section3. Any employeelosing time as provided in section 1 shall
supply his employerwith a statementfrom the chiefof his volunteerfire
companystatingthat he respondedto a call andthe time thereof.

Section4. As used in this act, “line of duty” shall meangoing to,
comingfrom or duringfire preventionandsafetyactivities which includes
fire prevention,first aid, rescueandsalvage,ambulanceservice,fire police
work, assistanceat accidents,control of crowdsbothon thefire grounds
andat occasionsof public or generalassembly,animalrescue,abatement
of conditionsdueto storm,flood or generalperil,abatementor removalof
hazardstosafetyandsuchotheractivities asare commonly-undei~takenby
fire companiesand their affiliated organizations.The term “employer”
includesany individual, partnership,association,corporation,business
trust, or anypersonor groupof personsactingdirectlyor indirectly in the
interestof an employerin relation to any employee.

Section 5. Any employer who willfully and knowingly violates the
provisionsof this act shall be requiredto reinstatesuch employeeto his
former position andshall be requiredto pay suchemployeeall lost wages
and benefitsfor the period betweenterminationand reinstatement.Any
action to enforcethe provisionsof thisactshallbecommencedwithin the
period of two yearswithin the dateof violation and suchactionshall be
commencedin thecourtof commonpleasinwhich theemployeris located.

Section 6. This act shalltake effect immediately.

APPROVED—The1st day of December,A. D. 1977.
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