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No. 1978-237

AN ACT

HB 2352

Amendingtheactof June24, 1931 (P.L.1206,No.331),entitled“An actconcerning
townshipsof the first class;amending,revising,consolidating,and changingthe
law relating thereto,” further regulating contracts, advertisements,
specifications,andbids for certaincontracts.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section 1. Subsection(a), the first paragraphand clause (2) of
subsection(d) of section 1802 and section1802.1, act of June24, 1931
(P.L.l206,No.331),knownas“TheFirstClassTownshipCode,”reenacted
andamendedMay 27, 1949 (P.L.l955,No.569)andamendedNovember
23, 1976(P.L.l135,No.243),areamendedandsection1802is amendedby
addingasubsectionto read:

Section 1802. GeneralRegulationsConcerningContracts.—(a) All
contractsor purchasesmadebyanytownship,involvingtheexpenditureof
over [two thousanddollars,Jtwo thousandfive hundreddollars, except
thosehereinaftermentioned,shallnot bemadeexceptwith andfrom the
lowest responsiblebidder,shallbe in writing, andshallbe madeonly after
noticeby thesecretary,published,in onenewspaperofgeneralcirculation,
publishedor circulatingin thecountyin which thetownshipis situated,at
least threetimes at intervals of not less than three days where daily
newspapersof generalcirculationare employedfor suchpublication,or in
caseweeklynewspapersareemployedthen the noticeshallbe published
oncea week for two successiveweeks.The first advertisementshall be
publishednot lessthan ten daysprior to the datefixed for theopeningof
bids. All plansandspecificationsshallbeonfile atleasttendaysinadvance
of openingbids. The amountof the contractshallin all cases,whetherof
straight saleprice, conditionalsale,bailment lease,or otherwise,be the
entire amount which the townshippays to the successfulbidder or his
assignsin orderto obtaintheservicesorproperty,orboth,andshallnotbe
construedto meanonly the amount which is paid to acquiretitle or to
receiveany otherparticularbenefit or benefitsof the wholebargain.

(d) The contractsor purchasesmadeby the commissionersinvolving
anexpenditureof over [two thousanddollars] two thousandfivehundred
dollars, which shallnot requireadvertisingor bidding, as hereinbefore
provided,are as follows:

(2) Thosemadefor improvements,repairs andmaintenanceof any
kind made or provided by any township through its own employes:
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Provided, however,That all materialsused for street improvement,
maintenance,and!or constructionin excessof [two thousand dollars] two
thousandfivehundreddollarsbesubjecttotheadvertisingrequire1.ncnts~as
containedherein.

(e) Every contract for the construction, reconstruction, alteration,
repair, improvementormaintenanceofpublicworksshailcomplywiththe
provisionsoftheact ofMarch3,1978(No.3),knownasthe“SteelProducts
ProcurementAct.”

Section 1802.1. Evasion of Advertising Requirements.—No
commissioneror commissionersshallevadethe provisionsof sectionone
thousandeight hundredtwo asto advertisingfor bids, by purchasingor
contractingfor servicesandpersonalpropertiespiecemealfor thepurpose
of obtaining prices under [two thousanddollars] two thousandfive
hundred dollars upon transactions,which transactionsshould, in the
exercise of reasonablediscretion and prudence,be conductedas one
transactionamountingto morethan [two thousanddollars] two thousand
five hundred dollars. This provision is intendedto makeunlawful the
evadingof advertisingrequirementsby making aseriesof purchasesor
contractseachfor lessthantheadvertisingrequirementprice,orbymaking
severalsimultaneouspurchasesorcontracts,eachbelowsaidprice,whenin
either case,the transactionsinvolved should havebeen made as one
transactionfor oneprice. Any commissionerswho so votein violationof
this provision,andwho know that thetransactionuponwhichtheysovote
is oroughtto bea partof a largertransaction,andthat it isbeingdivided in
order to evadethe requirementsas to advertisingfor bids,shallbejointly
andseverallysubjecttosurchargefor ten percentumof thefull amountof
the contractor purchase.Wheneverit shall appearthat acommissioner
mayhavevotedin violation of this section,but thepurchaseorcontracton
which heso voted wasnotapprovedby theboardof commissioners,this
sectionshall be inapplicable.

Section2. This act shall takeeffect in 60 days.

APPROVED—The4th day of October,A. D. 1978.

MILTON J. SHAPP


