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No. 1986-148

AN ACT

SB 1421

Amending theactof July 12, 1972 (P.L.762,No.180), entitled “An actrelating
to intergovernmentalcooperation,” further jroviding for direct purchases
from certainvendorsor suppliersof goods;andprovidingfor joint purchases
withcertainschoolsandprivateagencies.

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsasfollows:

Section 1. Theactof July 12, 1972(P.L.762,No.180),referredto asthe
IntergovernmentalCooperationLaw, is arhendedby addingsectionstoread:

Section7.2. In addition to joint purchasesauthorizedbysection7.1,
municipalitiesare furtherauthorizedto makedirectpurchasesfrom vendors
orsuppliersofgoods,materialsorequipmentwithoutcompliancewith exist-
ing andotherwiseapplicablestatutoryrequirementsgoverningcompetitive
biddingandexecutionofcontracts,asfollows:

(1) AnyCountymaybyappropriateresolution,andsubjectto suchrea-
sonableregulationsas it mayprescribe,permitanymunicipality within the
countyto participate in orpurchaseoff contractsfor goods,materialsor
equipmententeredinto bythecounty.

(2) Any municipality desiring to participate in suchpurchasecontracts
shallfile with the countypurchasingagencyand with the county-solicitora
certifiedcopyofan ordinanceor resolutionofits governingbodyrequesting
that it beauthorizedto participatein purchasecontractsof the countyand
agreeingthat it will be boundbysuchtermsand conditionsas the county
may, andashereafterprovidedshall,prescribeandthat ft will beresponsible
forpaymentdfrectiytothevendorundereachpurchasecontract

(3) The countymaypermit such participation by municipalitiesonly
wherethe solicitationfor bids andspecificationsforsuchcountycontracts,
andsuchcontractsthemselves,expresslyprovideforandinformprospective
andsuccessfulbiddersthat thecontractto belet is intendedto bésubjectto
thisact andto regulationsadoptedbythecountyhereunder.

(4) Amongsuchtermsandconditionsas thecountymayspecify,.i2~hall
prescribethatallpricesshallbeF.O.B. destination.

Section7.3. Any county or municipality may, by ordinance, authorize
joint purchasesof materials, suppliesand equipmentwith any private
school,parochialschool,private college or universityor nonprofithuman
servicesagencywithin the countyor municipalityas the casemay be. Any
suchordinanceshall requirethat theschool,collegeoragencyshallbebound
by the terms and conditionsof purchasingagreementsas the countyor
municipality shallprescribeand that the school, collegeor agencyshall be
responsibleforpaymentdirectly to thevendorundereachpurchasecontract.
Schools,collegesand agenciesshall be exemptfrom anyexistingstatutory



SESSIONOF 1986 Act 1986-148 1473

requirementsgoverningcompetitivebiddingandexecutionofcontractswith
respecttopurchasesunderthissection.

Section2. Thisactshalltakeeffectin60days.

APPROVED—The28thdayof November,A. D. 1986.

DICK THORNBURGH


