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No. 1986-196

AN ACT

HB 293

Amendingtheactof August9, 1955 (P.L.323,No.130),entitled“An actrelating
tocountiesof thethird, fourth,fifth, sixth,seventhandeighthclasses;amend-
ing, revising, consolidatingandchangingthe laws relating thereto,”further
providing for reportsof the controller or auditors and for appealsfrom
reports.

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsasfollows:

Section1. Sections1730and1731 of theact of August9, 1955 (P.L.323,
No.130),knownasTheCountyCode,areamendedtoread:

Section 1730. Filing Reports.—(a) The reports of the controller or
auditorsshallbefiled amongtherecordsof thecourtof common-pleas~of--the
countyl,andfrom thetimeof suchfiling shall havetheeffectof ajudgment
againsttherealestateof the officerwhoshalltherebyappearto beindebted
eitherto theCommonwealthor tothecountyl.

(b) Theamountofanybalanceor shortage,or ofanyexpenditureofa
kind, or madein a manner,prohibitedor notauthorizedbystatute,which
causesafinancial lossto thecountyshall bea surchargeagainstanyofficer
againstwhomsuchbalanceorshortageshallappear,or who by vote, act or
neglect, has permittedor approvedsuch expenditure,but no electedor
appointedofficial ofacountyshall besurchargedforanyact, error oromis-
sion in excessofthe actualfinancial losssustainedby the county, andany
surchargeshall take into considerationas its basisthe resultsofsuchact,
error oromissionandtheresultshadtheprocedurebeenstrictlyaccordingto
law. Theprovisionshereoflimiting the amountofanysurchargeshall not
applyto casesinvolvingfraudorcollusionon thepartofofficers,nor to any
penaltyenuringto thebenefitorpayableto theCommonwealth.

Section 1731. Appeals from Reports.—Anappealmay be takenfrom
suchreportstothe courtof commonpleas,eitherby theCommonwealth,the
county or theofficer. Suchappealmayalso betakenby tenor moretaxpay-
ersinbehalfof thecounty,in themannerandsubjectto therestrictionspro-
videdby articletwenty-eightof thisact.

Suchappealshall be enteredby the Commonwealthwithin four months,
andby thecounty and the officer within sixty daysafter the filing of the
report. (If theofficer is the appellant, he shall enter into arecognizancewith
two sufficientsuretiesindoublethesumfounddueby suchreport,with con-
dition to prosecutetheappealwith effect andto paythe costsandsuchsum
of moneyas shallappearon thefinal determinationof theappealto bedue
from him.J Upon appeal to the court of commonpleas,the controller or
auditorsshallberequiredto establishthevalidity ofthesurchargeandshall
establish the loss sustainedto the county. If the surchargeis upheldon
appealtothecourtofcommonpleas,theofficersosurchargedshallimmedi-
atelypaythecostsandmoneydueto thecounty.
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Section2. Thisactshallberetroactiveto January1, 1978.
Section3. Thisactshalltakeeffectimmediately.

APPROVED—The17thdayof December,A. D. 1986.

DICK T}IORNBURGH


