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SB 356

Amendingthe act of June23, 1931 (P.L.932, No.317),entitled “An act relating
to cities of the third class;andamending,revising,andconsolidatingthe law
relatingthereto,”increasingthe fine forordinanceviolations.

The General Assembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsas follows:

Section 1. Clause 60 of section2403 of the act of June 23, 1931
(P.L.932,No.317), known as The Third ClassCity Code, reenactedand
amendedJune28, 1951 (P.L.662,No.164),is amendedto read:

Section2403. SpecificPowers.—Inadditionto otherpowersgrantedby
this act,thecouncilof eachcity shallhavepower,by ordinance:

60. Local Self-Government.—Inaddition to the powersand authority
vestedin eachcity by the provisionsof this act, to makeandadoptall such
ordinances, by-laws, rules and regulations, not inconsistent with or
restrainedby theConstitutionand laws of this Commonwealth,as maybe
expedientor necessaryfor the propermanagement,careandcontrol of the
city and its finances,and the maintenanceof the peace,good government,
safetyand welfareof the city, and its trade, commerceand manufactures;
andalso all suchordinances,by-laws, rulesand regulationsasmaybe neces-
sary in and to the exerciseof thepowersandauthorityof local self-govern-
mentin all municipal affairs;andthesaidordinances,by-laws,rules andreg-
ulationsto alter, modify, and repealat pleasure;and to enforceall ordi-
nancesinflicting penaltiesupon inhabitantsor otherpersonsfor violations
thereof,not exceeding[three hundredj one thousand dollars [for any one
offense,]a violation of a building, housing, propertymaintenance,health,
fire orpublicsafetycodeorordinance,andfor water,afr andnoisepollution
violations, andnot exceedingsixhundreddollarsfor a violation ofanyother
ordinance, recoverablewith costs,togetherwith judgmentof imprisonment,
notexceedingninetydays,if theamountof saidjudgmentandcostsshallnot
be paid: Provided,however,That no ordinance,by-law, rule or regulation
shall bemadeor passedwhich contravenesor violatesany of the provisions
of theConstitutionof theUnitedStatesor of this Commonwealth,or of any
act of Assemblyheretoforeor that may be hereafterpassedand in force in
saidcity.

Section2. Thisactshalltakeeffectin60 days.

APPROVED—The3rd dayof December,A. D. 1987.

ROBERT P. CASEY


