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No. 1989-86

AN ACT

SB 1200

Authorizingthe releaseof Project70rertrictionsimposedon certain1ands~owned
by the Borough of Mechanicsburg,CumberlandCounty, in return for the
imposition of Project70 restrictionson certain lands to be conveyedto the
Boroughof Mechanicsburg,CumberiandCounty;andauthorizingtheDepart-
ment of GeneralServices,with the approval of the Departmentof Public
Welfare,to leaseto theLehighCountyHousingAuthority 1.7578acresof land
atAllentown StateHospital, LehighCounty.

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsasfollows:

Section1. Authorization.
Pursuantto therequirementsof section20(b) of theactof June22, 1964

(Sp.Sess.,P.L.131, No.8), known as the Project70 Land Acquisition and
Borrowing Act, the GeneralAssemblyherebyauthorizesthe releaseof the
restrictionsimposedby section20 of the Project 70 Land Acquisitionand
Borrowing Act from the lands owned by the Borough of Mechanicsburg,
CumberlandCounty,andmoreparticularly describedin section3 of this act
in exchangefor the impositionof the section20 restrictionson landsto be
conveyedto the Boroughof Mechanicsburgfrom NewPennMotor Express,
Inc. andmoreparticularlydescribedin section4.
Section2. Freedomof restrictions.

The landsdescribedin section3 andownedby the Boroughof Mechan-
icsburg,CumberlandCounty, shall be free of the restrictionson use and
alienation imposedby section20 of the act of June22, 1964 (Sp.Sess.,
P.L.131, No.8), known as the Project70 Land Acquisition and Borrowing
Act, upontheimpositionof andrecordingof theProject70 deedrestrictions
set forth in section5 on theparcelof replacementlanddescribedin section4
to be conveyedto the Borough of Mechanicsburgfrom New Penn Motor
Express,Inc., contemporaneouslywith theconveyanceof land describedin
section3.
Section3. Landto befreefromrestrictions.

Theparcelof landauthorizedto be releasedfrom restrictionsis morepar-
ticularly describedasfollows:

All that certain tract of land situatein the Borough of Mechanicsburg,
County of Cumberland,Commonwealthof Pennsylvania,boundedand
describedasfollows:

Beginningat the northwestcornerof thetracthereindescribed,saidpoint
being locatednorth 15 degrees33 minutes40 secondseast,a distanceof
466.73feetfrom thesouthwestcorner of the landconveyedby ThePennsyl-
vaniaRailroad Companyto the Boroughof Mechanicsburgby deeddated
June22, 1966,andrecordedamongtheland recordsof CumberlandCounty
in Deed BookA, Vol. 22, Page247; thencealong landsformerly of Isaac
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Heller, north82 degrees06 minutes30 secondseast,adistanceof 978.34feet
to a point; thencealong lands of MechanicsburgBorough (Soldiers and
Sailors Memorial Park), south05 degrees53 minutes 30 secondseast, a
distanceof 253.19feet to apoint; thencealongthenortherlyline of landsto
be retainedby MechanicsburgBorough, of whichthis was formerlya part,
south79 degrees59minutes25 secondswest,adistanceof 1,097.63feet to a
point; thencealong lands formerly of IsaacHeller, north 15 degrees33
minutes40secondseast,adistanceof 320.04feettothepointof beginning.

Containing6.479acresof land.
Under andsubject neverthelessto apermanenteasementin favor of the

Boroughof Mechanicsburg,CumberlandCounty, to usea portionof the
landforpublic recreationpurposes,towit:

All that certaintract of land situatein the Borough of Mechanicsburg,
County of Cumberland,Commonwealthof Pennsylvania,boundedand
describedasfollows:

Beginningatthenorthwestcornerof thetract hereindescribed,saidpoint
being locatednorth 15 degrees33 minutes40 secondseast,a distance of
285.27feet from the southwestcornerof theland conveyedby the Pennsyl-
vaniaRailroadCompanyto the Boroughof Mechanicsburg,by deeddated
June22, 1966,andrecordedamongthelandrecordsof CumberlandCounty
in DeedBook A, Vol. 22,Page247; thencerunningin andthroughtheabove
referencedtract, north79 degrees59 minutes25 secondseast,adistanceof
1,010.87feet to a point; thencealong the westerly line of Memorial Park
Drive,byacurveto theleft havingaradiusof 200.00feet, anarcdistanceof
107.27feet, thechord of which is north 13 degrees52 minutes39 seconds
east,105.99feet,to apoint; thencealongtheeasterlyline of the aboverefer-
encedtract, and along lands of MechanicsburgBorough (Soldiersand
Sailors Memorial Park), south05 degrees53 minutes 30 secondseast,a
distanceof 222.49feet to a point; thencesouth79 degrees59 minutes25
secondswest,adistanceof 1,097.63feetto a point; thencealonglandsfor-
merly of IsaacHeller, now of New PennMotor Express,Inc., north 15
degrees33 minutes40 secondseast,adistanceof 138.58feetto thepoint of
beginning.

Containing3.105acresof land.
Section4. Landonwhichrestrictionsaretobeimposed.

Thereplacementparcelto be subjectto restrictionsin exchangefor the
parceldescribedin section3 ismoreparticularlydescribedasfollows:

All thatcertaintract or parcelof land situatein the Boroughof Mechan-
icsburg,Countyof Cumberland,Commonwealthof Pennsylvania,bounded
anddescribedasfollows:

Beginningat a point in thecenterline of HeinzStreet(60 feetwide), said
pointbeinglocatedsouth79 degrees59 minutes25 secondswest,adistance
of 587.81feetfromtheintersectionof thesaidcenterline of HeinzStreetand
the westerly line of North York Street(80 feet wide); thencealonglandsof
MechanicsburgClub,south09 degrees27 minutes37 secondseast,adistance
of 369.64 feet to a point; thencealong landsof MechanicsburgBorough
(Soldiers and Sailors Memorial Park), south81 degrees52 minutes 13
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secondswest,adistanceof 648.12feetto apoint; thencealonglandsof New
PennMotor Express,Inc., of which thistractwas formerlya part,north 10
degrees00minutes35 secondswest,adistanceof 348.36feetto apoint in the
centerof Heinz Street; thencealong the said centerline of Heinz Street,
north79 degrees59 minutes25 secondseast,adistanceof 651.32feetto the
pointof beginning.

Containing5.354acresof land.
Beingapartof Lot No. 2-B asshownon a Preliminary/FinalPlanof the

MechanicsburgClub dated July 24, 1984, and recordedin the Office of
Recorderof Deedsin andfor CumberlandCounty, Pennsylvaniain Plan
Book46,Page82.
Section5. Descriptionof deedrestrictions.

Thedeedrestrictionto be transferredto the parceldescribedin section4
shallreadasfollows:

This indentureis given to provide land for recreation,conservationand
historicalpurposesassaidpurposesaredefinedin the actof June22, 1964
(Sp.Sess.,P.L.131, No.8), known asthe Project70 Land Acquisition and
BorrowingAct.
Section6. LeasetoLehighCountyHousingAuthority.

(a) The Departmentof General Services,with the approval of the
Departmentof Public Welfare,actingon behalfof the Commonwealthof
Pennsylvania,is herebyauthorizedto leaseto the Lehigh CountyHousing
Authority for an annualrentalof $1 for aperiod of 55 years,thefollowing
describedpremises:

All that certainlot or tractof landlying on thesouthsideof EastGordon
Streetas shown on the plan of propertyfor Valley HousingDevelopment
Corporation,preparedby Martin H. SchulerCompany,EngineersandSur-
veyors,situatein the 15thWard, andmoreparticularlydescribedasfollows:

Beginningata concretemonumentalong southernpropertyline of East
GordonStreet(40.00feet wide), saidpointbeing located289.13feet westof
intersectionof the southernproperty line of EastGordon Streetandthe
westernpropertyline of North OswegoStreet(30.00 feet wide) extended;
thence,extendingalong the southernpropertyline of EastGordon Street
south86 degrees00 minutes00 secondseast289.13 feet to a point; thence,
extendingalong lands now or late of Allentown State Hospital south03
degrees48 minutes00 secondswest256.51 feet to apoint; thence,extending
along landsnow or late of Allentown State Hospitalnorth 84 degrees39
minutes21 secondswest316.37feetto apoint;thenceextendingalonglands
now or late of Old Forge Corporatilon and lands now or late of Jeffrey
Rehfussnorth 10 degrees01 minutes09 secondseast250.47feetto theplace
of beginning.

Containing1.7578acres.
(b) Theleaseshallgrantthe lessee,theLehigh CountyHousingAuthor-

ity, the right to subleasethe above describedpremisesto construct and
operate20unitsof housingforpersonswith seriousmentalillness.

(c) The leaseagreementshallbeexecutedby the Departmentof General
Services,with the approvalof the Departmentof Public Welfare, in the
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nameof theCommonwealthandshallbecontingentupon andsubject-tothe
terms,conditionsandprovisionsasagreeduponby theaffectedparties.
Section7. Effectivedate.

Thisactshalltakeeffectimmediately.

APPROVED—The20thdayofDecember,A. D. 1989.

ROBERT P. CASEY


