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AN ACT

HB 67

Amendingtheactof October28, 1966(1stSp.Sess.,P.L.55,No.7),entitled “An
actdefining,regulatingandrelatingtoretail installmentcontractsfor all goodsr
andservicesexceptcertainmotorvehiclesand homeimprovements;prescrib-
ing the requirementsof such contractsand limitations on the enforcement
thereof;andprovidingremediesandpenalties,”reenactingandamendingpro-
visionsrelatingto servicecharges;andrestrictingcollectionactivitie&

The GeneralAssembly of the Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniahereby
enactsasfollows:

Section 1. Section 501(a) and (b) of the act of October 28, 1966 (1st
Sp.Sess.,P.L.55,No.7), knownastheGoodsandServicesInstallmentSales
Act, reenactedJuly 11, 1989(P.L.573, No.57),arereenactedtoread:

Section501. (a) A sellermay, in aretail installmentcontract,contract
for and, if so contractedfor, the holder thereofmay charge,receiveand
collect a servicechargemeasuredfor aperiodbetweenthedateof suchcon-
tractandthe duedateof the last installmentandcalculatedfor that period
accordingto the actuarialmethodof computationor by applicationof the
United Statesruleat a ratewhich doesnotexceedthe equivalentof eighteen
percent(l8Wo) simpleinterestperannum.

(b) Notwithstandingtheratesprovidedfor in this section,no issuerof a
creditcard primarily engagedas a seller or distributorof gasolineshall be
permittedto charge,receiveor collect a servicechargein excessof fifteen
percent(15%)simpleinterestperannumon unpaidbalances.

Section2. Section604 of theactis amendedto read:
Section604. After the paymentof all sumsfor which the buyer is obli-

gatedundera contractandupondemandmadeby thebuyer,theholdershall
deliver, or mail to the buyerat his last known address,suchone or more
good and sufficient instrumentsas may be necessaryto acknowledge
paymentin full andtoreleaseall securityin thegoodsundersuchcmieract.

A selleror holdershall not,in thecourseofcollectingan obligationpursu-
ant to this act, communicateor threatento communicatewith the buyer’s
employeror anyagentoftheemployer(otherthanto verify employmentor
to leavea messagefor the buyerto return a telephonecall), or any other
personnot liablefor the obligation other thanthe buyer’sspouse,an adult
memberof the buyer’shouseholdor the attorneyofthe buyer, exceptto
acquire location information with regard to the buyerfrom suchperson
(withoutdisclosingthefact ofthe obligation)or aspermittedbyorder ofa
court or as reasonablynecessaryto effectuatea post-judgmentjudicial
remedy.

Section 3. Section904(a) of the act, reenactedJuly 11, 1989(P.L.573,
No.57),is reenactedtoread:
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Section904. Subjectto the otherprovisionsof this articlethe selleror
holder of a retail installmentaccountmay charge,receiveandcollect the
servicechargeauthorizedby thisact. Theservicechargeshallnot exceedthe
following rates computedon the outstandingbalancesfrom month to
month:

(a) On the outstandingbalance,oneandone-halfpercent(1 1/2%) per
month.

Section4. Sections904.2(c) and 904.3 of the act, reenacted and
amendedJuly 11, 1989 (P.L.573, No.57), are reenactedand amendedto
read:

Section 904.2. * * *

(c) (Thisi Subsection(a) of this section shall expireon June 1, 1994,
unlessextendedbystatute.Subsection(b) ofthissectionshallexpirethree(3)
yearsfromFebruary26, 1988,unlessextendedby statute.

Section 904.3. The ratespermittedundersections501(a)and904(a)shall
automaticallyrevert to the ratesin effect on March 24, 1982, unlessspe-
cifically reenactedon or before[Febniary26,19911June1, 1994.

Section5. Thisactshalltakeeffectimmediately.

APPROVED—The21stdayof February,A. D. 1991.

ROBERT P. CASEY


