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No. 2002-104

AN ACT

SB 1187

Authorizing the Department of General Services,with the approval of the Governor,
to grant and convey to Tolentine Community Center and Development
Corporation certain lands and building situate in the City of Philadelphia,
PhiladelphiaCounty.

The GeneralAssemblyof the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania hereby

enactsasfollows:

Section 1. The Departmentof GeneralServices,with theapprovalof the
Governor, is hereby authorized on behalf of the Commonwealth of
Pennsylvaniato grant and convey to Tolentine Community Center and
DevelopmentCorporationthe formerArmory at 1231 SouthBroad Street,
Cityof Philadelphia,consistingof aparcelof land andbuilding asdescribed
in section2 for fair considerationequal to the fair market value of the
propertyas determinedby an independentappraiser.

Section2. Thetracttobeconveyedis situatein theCity of Philadelphia,
PhiladelphiaCounty,Pennsylvania,boundedanddescribedasfollows:

ALL THAT CERTAIN lot or pieceof groundwith thebuildingsthereon
erectedSITUATE on the Eastside of Broad Street in the Twenty-sixth
Ward of the City of Philadelphiacomposedof six contiguouslots or pieces
of groundviz threethereofcommencingat thedistanceof onehundredand
twenty-five feet Northward from the North side of Wharton Street,
containingtogetherin front or breadthon thesaidBroadStreetseventy-five
feet andextendingin length or depthEastwardlytwo hundredand twenty
feetsix inches,boundedon the Southby groundnowor lateof RobertRoss,
on the East by ground now or late of JamesBond and William G.
Alexander, on the North by the lot next described,andon the West by
BroadStreetaforesaid;oneother thereofcommencingat thedistanceof two
hundredfeetNorthwardfrom theNorth sideof WhartonStreet,containing
in front or breadthon the saidBroadStreettwenty-five feet andextending
in length or depth Eastwardof that width betweenparallellines at right
anglesto the saidBroad Streettwo hundredand twenty feet six inches;
boundedNorthwardby the lot next described,Southwardby the lot last
above described,Eastwardby groundlateof JamesBondandWilliam G.
Alexander and Westward by said Broad Street; one other of them
commencingatthedistanceof two hundredandtwenty-fivefeet Northward
from theNorthsideof WhartonStreet,containing in front or breadthon the
saidBroadStreetseventeenfeet andextendingin depth Eastwardon the
South line thereof parallel with said Wharton Street, two hundredand
twenty feet six inchesandon the North Line in aNortheasterlydirection
two hundredandtwenty-two feet moreor less, andcontainingon the rear
and thereofand parallel with BroadStreet, thirty-four feet seveninches;
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boundedon the North by the lot nextdescribed,on theEastby groundlate
of saidBond andAlexanderon the Southby the lot lastdescribed,and on
the West by Broad Street; andthe other thereofat the distance of two
hundredand forty-two feet Northward from the North side of Wharton
Street,thenceextendingon aline SouthEighty-twodegreesfifteen minutes
Eastby thelot lastdescribedtwo hundredfeet tenandahalf inchest~afifty
feet wide streetcalledWattsStreet, thenceNorthwardalong theWest side
of the saidWatts StreetElevenfeet two inches,thenceWestwardat right
angleto saidBroadStreet, two hundredfeet to the saidBroadStreet,and
thenceSouthwardalong theEastsideof the saidBroadStreetthirty feetto
theplaceof beginning.

Section3. Theconveyanceshallbemadeunderandsubjectto all lawful
andenforceableeasements,servitudesandrights of others,including,but
not confmedto, streets,roadwaysand rights of any telephone,telegraph,
water, electric, cable, gas or pipeline companies,as well as under and
subjectto any lawful andenforceableestatesor tenanciesvestedin third
personsappearingof record, for any portion of the land or improvements
erectedthereon.

Section4. Thedeedof conveyanceshallbe by specialwarrantydeedand
shallbe executedby the Secretaryof GeneralServicesin the nameof the
Commonwealthof Pennsylvania.

Section 5. The deedof conveyanceshall contain aclauserestrictingthe
use of the property for community social serviceprograms.Should the
Tolentine Community Center and Development Corporation allow the
propertyto beusedfor anypurposeother thanfor communitysocial service
programsor attemptsto conveythe property,title shall immediatelyrevert
to andrevestin theCommonwealthof Pennsylvania.

Section 6. The deedof conveyanceshall alsocontainaclauserequiring
the TolentineCommunityCenterand DevelopmentCorporationto ensure
thatanydesignfornewconstruction,rehabilitation,alterationor demolition
work on thepropertyis compatiblewith its original architecturaldesignand
landscape/siteplan in termsof scale,massing,fenestration,materialsand
color andis consistentwith therecommendedapproachesin the Secretary
of the Interior’s Standards for Rehabilitation and Guidelines for
Rehabilitating Historic Buildings as revised in 1995, and no new
construction,demolition, alteration,remodeling or landscaping/sitework
shall beundertakenor permittedto be undertakenon the propertywithout
30 days’ prior written notice to the PennsylvaniaHistorical and Museum
Commission.

Section7. Costsandfeesincidentalto this conveyanceshallbeborneby
thegrantee.

Section8. In the eventthat within oneyearof theeffectivedateof this
act this conveyanceis not executedin accordancewith the agreementof
sale,the propertymaybe disposedof in accordancewith Article 2406-Aof
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the actof April 9, 1929 (P.L.177,No.175), knownas TheAdministrative
Codeof 1929.

Section9. Thisact shalltakeeffectimmediately.

APPROVED—The29thdayof June,A.D. 2002.

MARK S. SCHWEIKER


