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forceuntil theendof thefirst sitting of thenextgeneralassem-
biy andno longer.

PassedJanuary2, 1778. Seethe note to the Act o~Assembly
passedMarch17, 1757, Chapter421; andtheActso~Assemblypassed
March 12, 1778, Chapter787; September10, 1778, Chapter814; No-
vember30, 1778, Chapter821; April 5, 1779, Chapter844.

CHAPTER DCCLXXXI.

A FURTHER SUPPLEMENTTO THE ACT, ENTITLED “AN ACT TO REL~-
LATE THE MILITIA OF THE COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVA-
NIA.” 1

(SectionI, P. L.) Whereasby an actof generalassemblyof
this commonwealththe powersgiven to the supremeexecutive
council for calling out themilitia into actualservicearenot so
ciearlyanddistinctly expressed,but thatsomemisconstructions
may arisethereon. And the modethereinprescribedfor the
lieutenantandsub-lieutenantsto notify the differentclassesof
themilitia is foundtediousanddifficult:

[SectionI.] (SectionII, P. L.) Be it enacted,andit is hereby
enactedby the Representativesof the Freemenof theCommon-
wealth of Pennsylvaniain GeneralAssemblymet, andby the
authorityof thesame,Thatwheneverit maybenecessaryto call
into actualserviceanypart of themilitia in caseof rebellion in
or invasionof this or any of the adjoiningstates,thenit shall
and may be lawful for the president or vice-presidentand
council to order into actualservicesuchpart of themilitia by
classesof anycountyor counties,asthe exigencymayrequire.
Provided,Thatthepart so calleddothnot exceedfour classesof
themilitia of the countyor countiessocalledout; andprovided
also that suchcountiesshall not be again called upon to fur-
nish any moremilitia until an equalnumberof classesof the
militia of the other countiesrespectivelybefirst called, unless
the dangerof an invasion from Indiansor othersshouldmake

1 PassedMardi 17, 1777, Chapter750.
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it necessaryto keep in reservethe militia of suchcounty or
countiesfor their own immediatedefense.

[SectionlU (SectionIII, P. L.) And be it further enacted
by theauthorityaforesaid,Thatthecommandingofficer of each
battalionis herebyrequiredimmediatelyto forwardtheorders
of thelieutenantor sub-lieutenantto thecommandingofficer of
eachcompanyrespectively,requiringhim to notify theclassor
classesof his companythenorderedto marchby writtennotices
left attheir usualplacesof abode,specifyingthetime andplace
of rendezvous,andthat the lieutenantor sub-lieutenantswill
hold an appeal,ashereafterdirected,at thetime and place
thereinappointed;andthat theseveralmilitia officers respect-
ively who shallbe employedin notifying themilitia in manner
aforesaidshallreceivethesumof tenshillingsperdiemfor their
trouble,to be paidto themby thelieutenantsor sub-lieutenants
out of thefinesrecoveredfrom delinquents.

(SectionIV, P. L.) And whereasthehiring of substitutesby
the lieutenantsandothersis by experiencefoundto haveob-
structedthe completionof the quotaof this stateto theconti-
nentalarmyto thegreatdamageofthecommoncause:

Therefore:
[SectionIII.] (SectionV, P. L.) Be it furtherenactedby the

authority aforesaid,That if any militia-man shall neglector
refuseto marchin personon theday appointedas aforesaid~
suchdelinquentshall forfeit andpaywithin five daysthesum
of forty poundsto thelieutenantor nearestsub-lieutenant,un-
lesshe producea sufficientsubstituteof orbelongingto his own
family. Providednevertheless,Thatevery personserving by
substituteasaforesaid,if saidsubstituteshallbecalled in his
own. turn into actualservicebeforethe term expireswhich he
wasto servefor his employer,that thenthepersonprocuring
suchsubstituteshall eithermarchin his thesaid substitute’s
turn or beliableto payhis fine for neglect;which fine is to be
recoveredasother fines for neglectof servingareby this act
directedto be recovered. Provided also, That sons, appren-
ticesorservantswho arenot subjectto themilitia law maybe
admittedassubstitutesfor their fathersor mastersif of suffi-
dentability of body, of which the commandingofficer of the~
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marching class togetherwith the lieutenantor ne~trestsub-
lieutenantshallbe judges.

(SectionVI, P. U.) Andwhereasthemodeof appealasdirected
in said actis foundtedious,and by thelengthof time allowed
for holding of thesamedelinquentsmayremoveand defeatthe
intent andmeaningof thesaidactby not payingtheir fines to
thegreatinjury of this commonwealthandto thedissatisfaction
of thoseof thegoodpeoplewho personallystepforth in defense
of their country:

Therefore:
[SectionIV.] (SectionVII, P. L.) Be it furtherenactedby the

authority aforesaid,That the lienutenantor one of the sub-
lieutenantsshallatt~ndat theplaceappointedfor thedifferent
classesto rendezvousandcallto hisassistancetwo freeholders,
one of whom shall bea justice of thepeace,to hearanddeter-
mine all appealsthat may be laid beforethemby thepersons
thinking themselvesaggrievedby anythingdone in pursuance
of this act,or theactto which this is a supplement;andthey
areherebyauthorizedandrequiredto grantsuchrelief to such
appellantsasto themshallappearjust and reasonable,in con-
siderationof inability of bodyandestateonly.

[SectionV.] (SectionVIII, P. U.) And be it furtherenacted
by the authorityaforesaid,Thatif anydelinquentshallneglect
orrefuseto paythefineaforesaidwithin five daysafterthe ap-
pealaforesaid,it shall andmaybe lawful for the lieutenantor
anyone sub-lieutenantto issuehis warrantto thesheriff, con-
stableor otherfit personto levy the aforesaidfine by distress
and saleof theoffender’s goodsand chattels,landsand tene
ments,togetherwith five per cent.in full for his trouble,for
levying, selling andcollecting. But if no suchgoodsandchat-
tels, landsandtenements,canbe found,thento seizeandtake
thebody of suchoffenderand commithim to thecommongaol
or someother placeof closeconfinementfor thespaceof four
monthsunlesshesoonerpaysthe said fine; and no [process]
shall issueto staytheexecutionof suchwarrantunlessin the
caseoftheseizureof realestates.

[SectionVI.] (SectionIX, P. L.) And be it furtherenactedby
theauthority aforesaid,Thatbeforethe lieutenantor sub-lieu-
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tenantandjustice of thepeacesit to hearanddetermineupon
anyappealof which theyareherebydirectedto judgeshallhave
takentherespectiveoathsor affirmationsof officeprescribedby
theconstitution,andthesaid freeholderbeforeheshall sit on
thesaidappealshalltakethefollowing oathoraffirmation,viz.:

“That hewill hearandimpartially determineon thecasesof
appealthat maybelaid beforehim,agreeableto law andaccord-
ing to thebestof his knowledge:”

Whichoathoraffirmation thesaidjustice, lieutenantor sub-
lieutenantis herebyempoweredand requiredto administer.
Andthesaidjusticeandfreeholdershallhaveandreceivefrom
thesaidlieutenantorsub-lieutenantthesumof twentyshillings
eachfor eachdaytheyshallsit on thesaidappeals.

(SectionX, P. L.) Andwhereasmanymilitia-menby removing
from onebattalionorcompanyto anotherfind meansto escape
their tour of duty, and therebydefeatthe good intent of the
militia law:

Therefore:
[SectionVII.] (SectionXI, P. U.) Be it enactedby the au-

thority aforesaid,That no militia-man shall withdraw himself
from the companyto which hebelongsunderthe penalty of
five poundsto be suedfor and recoveredfor the useof this
stateby thecommandingofficerof thecompanyfrom which he
shall so withdraw himself beforeany justiceof the peaceby
actionof debt. Providednevertheless,Thatpersonsremoving
out of theboundsof one battalionor companyto anothershall
apply to the commandingofficer of the companyto which he
did belong,who shall give him a discharge,certifying theclass
to which hebelongsandwhetherhehasservedhistour of duty
or not, which certificatethe saidmilitia-man shall produceto
the captainor commandingofficer of the companyin whose
boundshenextsettleswithin tendaysafterhissettlementunder
penalty of five pounds, to be recoveredand applied as the
aforesaidfine is directedto be recoveredand applied;and the
captainor commandingofficer is herebyrequiredto enrollhim
in the classspecifiedin saidcertificate.

(SectionXII, P. L.) And whereasit is founduponexperience
that subjectingmembersof the generalassemblyto militia
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duties hasa tendencyto retardthe public business,manyof
themhavingbeencalledto servetheirtour in themilitia when
their attendanceat thesametimeis absolutelynecessaryin the
houseof assembly:

Therefore:
[SectionVIII.] (SectionXIII, P. L.) Beit enactedby theau-

thority aforesaid,That membersof generalassemblyfor the
timebeingshallbeandtheyareherebyexemptedfromperform-
ing militia duties,and from all tines for any neglectthereof
duringthe timethey continuemembers.

[SectionIX.] (SectionXIV, P. L.) Andbe it furtherenacted
by the authority aforesaid,That so muchof the actto which
this is a furthersupplement,asalsoso muchof thesaidsupple-
ment to thesaid militia actasis hereinor herebyamendedor
altered,areherebydeclaredto berepealed.

PassedDecember30, 1777. Seethenote to theAct of Assembly
passedMarch 17, 1777, Chapter750. The act in the text was re-
pealedby theAct of AssemblypassedMarch20, 1780, Chapter902.

CHAPTERDCCLXXXII.

AN ACT FOR THE BETTER SUPPLY OF THE ARMIES OF THE UNITED
STATES OF AMERICA.

(SectionI, P. U.) Whereasnotwithstandingthelargequanti-
ties of clothingwhich havebeenseasonablyorderedfrom Eu-
ropefor the armiesof theUnited Statesof America,adequate
supplieshavenot yet beenimported:

Andwhereasa regularandfixed modeof collectingandpro-
viding suchsuppliesascanbe furnishedin this statewill enable
the legislaturethereof to administeron any emergencymore
expeditouslyandeffectuallyto the necessitiesnot only of their
quotaof troops,but alsoof therestof thearmy:

[SectionU] (SectionII, P. L.) Be it enacted,andit is hereby
enactedby theRepresentativesof theFreemenof theCommon-
wealthof Pennsylvaniain GeneralAssembly met, and by the


