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CHAPTER MMCLXIIL

AN ACT TO AUTHORIZE ROGERALDEN TO ERECT A WING-DAM ON
FRENCH CREEK, IN THE COUNTY OF CRAWFORD.

[SectionI.] (Section1, P. L.) Be it enactedby the Senate
and Houseof Representativesof the Commonwealthof Penn-
sylvania,in GeneralAssembly met, and it is herebyenactedby
the authority of the same,That Roger Alden, his heirs andas-
signs,be,andtheyarehereby,authorizedto erecta wing-damon
Frenchcreek, adjoining his own land, in the countyof Craw-
ford, aboutsix miles aboveMeadi~iHe,andto extendthesameso
far into the creekasto leavean openingat low water,at least
forty feet wide, on the westside of said creek,and to keep the
same-in good repair forever;and also to leadoff therebyon his
own land,so much of thewaterof thesaidcreekasmaybe neces-
sary for his mills. Provided, That the said Roger Alden, his
heirsandassigns,in erectingthesaiddam,or in keepingthesame
in repair,or in drawingoff thewaterasaforesaid,shallnot there-
by in any degreeinjure or impede the navigation of the said
creek,or preventthe fish from passingup the same. And pro-
videdalso,ThatthesaidRogerAldenshallnot therebyinterfere
with anyprivatepropertyon the saidcreek.

[Section II.] (SectionII, P. L.) And be it further enacted
by the authority aforesaid,Thaton complaint of anypersonor
personsto thejudgesof thecourtof quartersessionsof thesaid
county, it shall aiid maybe lawful for thesaidjudgesto appoint
threecommissioners,to view the said clam, and to compareit
with the limitations and proyisions of this act, and report to
them at their nextsessionsin the said county the statethereof,
which report, if it containan offenceagainstthis act,or theact
declaringthe rivers Ohio and Allegheny,and certain branches
thereof, public streamsor highways,shall be sufficient ground
for thecourtto directabill of indictmentto be sentto thegrand
jury, andupon prosecutionto conviction,shall be liable to pay,
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for everysuchoffence,a finenot exceedingtwo hundred,norless
thanonehundreddollars,atthediscretionof thecourt,who shall
order so muchof the saiddam to be abatedby the supervisors
of the highways of the adjoining township, as shall bring the
samewithin the limitations and provisions of this act, at the
cost of thepersonso convicted.

PassedJanuary31, 1801.

CHAPTER MMCLXIV.

AN ACT TO ERECT THE COUNTY OF ADAMS INTO CERTAIN ELECTION
DISTRICTS.

[SectionI.] (SectionI, P. L.) Be it enactedby the Senate
and Houseof Representativesof the Commonwealthof Penn-
sylvania, in GeneralAssemblymet, and it is herebyenactedby
theauthorityof thesame,That, from andafterthepassingof this
act,the townshipsof Cumberland,FranklinandMannallen,and
thosepartsof Strabanetownship,on the westof a road leading
from Shriver’s mill, to George Lashel’s and Hunter’s town,
thencedowntheBeaver-damto the Conewago,areherebyerected
into an electiondistrict, to be called the first electiondistrict;
and theelectorsthereofshall hold their electionsat the court-
housein Gettysburg.

[SectionII.] (SectionII, P. L.) And be it furtherenacted
by the authorityaforesaid,Thatthetownship of Mountjoy and
Germany,and thoseparts of the townshipsof Heidelbergand
Manheimwithin the limits of the county of Adams,arehereby
erectedinto an electiondistrict, to be calledthesecondelection
district; andtheelectorsthereofshallhold their electionsat the
housenow occupiedby JacobWinrott, in thetown of Petersburg
in thetownshipof Germany.

[SectionIII.] (SectionIII, P.L.) Andbe it furtherenacted
by the authorityaforesaid,That the townshipsof Berwick and
Mount Pleasant,and thoseparts of Strabanetownship,on the


