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AN ACT GRANTING AN ANNUITY TO JOHNCRAIG.

Whereas it appearsthat John Craig, of Butler county,
served as a~soldier in CaptainChurch’s rifle company, fifth
Pennsylvania regiment, commanded by Colonel Anthony
Wayne,an~1that he waswounded,andas he is old andinfirm
andby reasonof his woundsunableto maintainhimself and
family by labor: Therefore,

Section I. (SectionI, P. L.) Be it enactedby the Senate
andHouseof Representativesof the Commonwealthof Penn-
sylvania, in GeneralAssemblymet, andit is herebyenacted
by the authority of the same,That the sum of forty dollars
be~andthe sameis herebygrantedto JohnCraig, to bepaid
to him or his lawful attorney immediatelyafter the passing
of this act, out of any unappropriatedmoney in the state-
treasury,andthat an annuity of forty dollars be grantedfor
the useof JohnCraig, to be paidto SamuelKinkead, esquire,
his executoror executors,administratoror administrators,his
or their lawful attorney,by the statetreasurer,to commence
on the first dayof January,one thousandeight hundredand
nine, which annuity shall be expendedby tTae said Samuel
Kinkead, esquire,his executor or executors,administrator
or administrators,his or their lawful attorney,in prOviding
clothing and diet for the said JohnCraig, and it shall and
herebyis madethe duty of the saidSamuelKinkead,esquire,
hi~executor or executors,administrator or administrators,
his or their lawful attorney,to makeanannualreturn to the
orphans’court of Butler county, on oath or affirmation, how
andin what mannerhe or they have executedthe trust in
him or them confidedby this act.
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